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LEGAL NOTES 
 
The website www.boninoitaly.com (hereinafter Website) is owned by Bonino s.r.l. with headquarters in Via 
Torino, 173 - 12048 Sommariva Bosco (Cuneo) Italy. 
By accessing and using the Website the user accepts all the conditions listed below. The information 
contained in the Website are accurate, however, it is not possible to exclude mistakes for which Bonino 
declines all responsibility. 
 
Reserved Property Rights: the content of the Website and all material published in it are provided exclusively 
for informational purposes to illustrate Bonino's competence, activities and products. The Website and its 
content, such as layout, slogans, data, text, graphics, photographs, videos, illustrations, music and other 
material are the exclusive property of Bonino s.r.l.. The duplication of the Website and its contents, any 
partial reproduction, downloading, the publication or dissemination by any means and the use of information 
or materials contained therein are prohibited, except for the download of the contents explicitly indicated as 
downloadable for personal use only and for non-commercial purposes, provided that the copyright and 
proprietary rights are upheld. 
 
Trademarks: Bonino is a registered trademark owned by Bonino s.r.l.. All the logos used in the Website and 
registered as trademarks by Bonino are its property. Third parties' trademarks and logos used in the Website 
are the exclusive property of their respective owners and may not be used or reproduced in any form. 
 
Use limitations of the Website: Bonino provides access to the Website only to obtain information about the 
company and its products. Therefore Bonino allows for the viewing and consultation of the Website 
exclusively for personal use and information. It is expressly forbidden to use any part of the Website, as well 
as the information or material contained therein, for commercial or advertising activities of any kind except 
with Bonino's written permission. Linking and framing of the Website's content is prohibited without Bonino's 
written permission. 
 
Privacy protection: Bonino pays particular attention to users' privacy. The information supplied by the user to 
Bonino through the Website will be treated with the utmost care in compliance with current Italian law about 
privacy protection. In this regard, please refer to the privacy policy (informativa sulla privacy). 

 
Applicable Law: the terms of use of the Website are governed by Italian laws. Any aspect not mentioned 
here is regulated by current Italian laws. 
 
 


